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NOTICE 
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LIST OF MODIFICATIONS MADE BY THIS TARIFF 
 
 

DECREASE 
 
 
Rider No. 20 – Smart Meter Charge Thirty-Sixth Revised Page No. 108 
 Cancelling Thirty-Fifth Revised Page No. 108 
 
 
The Smart Meter Charge has been adjusted as required by the provisions of the Rider. 
 
The monthly charge per meter has decreased from $4.27 to $4.24 for Single-Phase meters. 
 
 

INCREASE 
 
 
Rider No. 20 – Smart Meter Charge Thirty-Sixth Revised Page No. 108 
 Cancelling Thirty-Fifth Revised Page No. 108 
 
 
The Smart Meter Charge has been adjusted as required by the provisions of the Rider. 
 
The monthly charge per meter has increased from $6.07 to $6.29 for Poly-Phase meters. 
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(D) – Indicates Decrease                         (I) – Indicates Increase 
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 STANDARD CONTRACT RIDERS - (Continued) 
 
 

RIDER NO. 20 – SMART METER CHARGE 
 

(Applicable to Rates RS, RH, RA, GS/GM, GMH, GL, GLH, L, HVPS and AL) 
 
 
 PURPOSE 
 

The Smart Meter Charge (“SMC”) is instituted as a cost recovery mechanism to recover all costs to implement the 
Company’s Smart Meter Procurement and Implementation Plan (“Plan”).  The SMC has been added per 
Commission Order at Docket No. M-2009-2123948.  Act 129 (“Act”) became effective November 14, 2008, 
requiring all Pennsylvania electric distribution companies (“EDCs”) with more than 100,000 customers to 
implement smart meters.  Act 129 set forth the timeline for implementation, the definition of smart meters and the 
provisions for full and current cost recovery of all costs incurred by EDCs to install and make fully functional a 
smart meter system defined in and required by Act 129.  The Company filed its Plan on August 14, 2009, in 
compliance with the Act, including this Charge and provisions for cost recovery.  This Charge shall be updated as 
described below to recover all costs associated with implementing the Plan. 
 
The SMC is a non-bypassable charge and shall be applicable to the monthly bill of all metered customers based 
on the number of meters installed at the premise. 
 
 

ELIGIBLE COSTS 
 
The SMC recovers all eligible costs incurred by the Company to implement smart meter technology and the 
supporting infrastructure.  Eligible costs, described in 66 Pa. C.S. § 2807(f), include capital and expense items 
relating to all Plan elements, equipment and facilities, as well as all related administrative costs.  Plan costs 
include, but are not limited to, capital expenditures for any equipment and facilities that may be required to 
implement the Plan, as well as depreciation, operating and maintenance expenses, a return component based on 
the EDC’s weighted cost of capital and taxes.  In general, eligible administrative costs include, but are not limited 
to, incremental costs relating to Plan development, cost analysis, measurement and verification and reporting.  
The costs associated with testing, upgrades, maintenance and personnel training are considered eligible costs. 
 
 

MONTHLY SMART METER CHARGE 
 

 
Meter Type 

Monthly Charge 
Per Meter 

Single-Phase            $4.24 

Poly-Phase            $6.29 

 

The SMC, calculated independently for each meter type, shall be applied to all applicable customers served under 
the Tariff.  Customers will be billed based on the number of meter types installed at their premise.  Customers 
with multiple meters will incur multiple charges.  The SMC shall be determined in dollars and cents per month per 
meter in accordance with the formula described in the “Calculation of Charge” section and shall be applied to all 
applicable customers served during any part of a billing month. 
 

(D) 
(I) 


